

Project Name: Guilford County Law Enforcement Center Renovation  
Greensboro, NC 27401  
Project #: 17-496  
Time: 3:00 PM  
Place: Guilford County, 301 W. Market St., Greensboro, NC  
Date: 8/21/2018

**CERTIFIED BID TAB**  
Re-Bid Event # 629



Contract: General Construction - Single Prime

Contractor	License No. "Unlimited"	Attended Mandatory Pre-bid 7/10, 7/17, or 8/9	Bond/Check	MWBE Form A or B	Add. No. 1	Add. No. 2	Add. No. 3	Add. No. 4	Add. No. 5	Base Bid	Alt. No. 1 Interior Upfit of 3, 4, & 5 floors	Alt. No. 2 Yale Locks	Alt. No. 3 Exterior cleaning of the building	Alt. No. 4 Exterior precast concrete sealant joints, clean & prime joints and replace with new sealants and backer rod	Alt. No. 5 Enlarge existing window 16 enlarged openings per levels 3 thru 8	Alt. No. 6 Provide 5 yr extended chiller warranty and service	Alt. No. 7 Distributed Antenna System 700 MHz coverage for FirstNet capability	Alt. No. 8 Provide Alerton Controls
A Vogt Construction 4505 Sellers Ave Greensboro, NC27407	73557	10-Jul								no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted
Atlantic Contracting Co. 116 Stage Coach Trail Greensboro, NC 27409	64230	10-Jul								no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted
Bar Construction 611-A Industrial Ave Greensboro, NC 27406	7973	10-Jul 17-Jul 9-Aug	✓	A	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	\$17,200,000.00	\$1,406,700.00	\$0.00	\$431,000.00	\$183,000.00	\$385,000.00	\$48,000.00	\$90,600.00	\$0.00
H.M. Kern Corporation 160 Thatcher Rd. Greensboro, NC 27409	8542	10-Jul 17-Jul 9-Aug	✓	A	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	\$17,360,000.00	\$1,365,000.00	nc	\$82,000.00	\$107,000.00	\$307,000.00	\$46,000.00	\$3,500.00	nc
J.M. Thompson 1002 E Chatham Street Cary, NC 27511	474	10-Jul 17-Jul 9-Aug	✓	A	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	\$15,548,000.00	\$1,274,000.00	nc	\$81,600.00	\$104,500.00	\$257,000.00	\$45,000.00	\$2,100.00	nc
I.L. Long Construction Co. 4117 Indiana Ave. Greensboro, NC 27105	1722	17-Jul								no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted
Lomax Construction 8517-A Norcross Rd Colfax, NC 27235	37571	9-Aug	✓	A	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	\$17,274,200.00	\$1,208,900.00	nc	\$89,800.00	\$115,000.00	\$326,800.00	\$46,600.00	\$88,800.00	nc
S&S Contracting of NC 4-C Oak Branch Drive Greensboro, NC 28407	78401	none								no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted	no bid submitted